THE FINANCE ORDINANCE, 1985
ORDINANCE NO. XXXII OF 1985

[30" June, 1985]

An Ordinance to give effect to the financial proposals of

the Government and to amend certain laws.

WHEREAS it is expedient to make provisions to give effect
o the financial proposals of the Government and to amend

certain laws for the purposes hereinafter appearing;

Now, THEREFORE, 1n pursuance of the Proclamation of the
24th March, 1982, and in exercise of all powers enabling him in
that behalf, the President is pleased to make and promulgate the

following Ordinance:-

1. (1) This Ordinance may be called the Finance Ordinance,
1985.

(2) Except as otherwise provided in this Ordinance, this
section and sections 3 and 6 shall come into force at once, and
other sections shall come into force on the first day of July,

1985.

2. In the Stamp Act, 1899 (II of 1899), in Schedule I, in
article No. 23 -

(a) for the figure ‘“17.5%” the figure “18%" shall be

substituted; and

(b) for the hcading «Exemption.” and the existing entry
thereunder the following shall be substituted, namely:-

“EXEMPTIONS.

(a) Assignment of copyright under the Copyright

Ordinance, 1962, section 14.

y owned by an
limited company
rposes, provided
a shareholder of
alue of the

(b) Transfer of landed propert
industrial entreprencur to
incorporated for industrial pu
that the entreprencur becomes
the company to the extent of the v

property”.

Bangladesh Tax Update

www.kdroy.com.bd/www.ltr.com bd

Short title and
commencemem

Amendment of
Act 11 of 18399

Scanned with CamScanner



Amendment of 3. The following
Actl of 1944 N

"hC’ i
f!lfll}(.
05
Mye,

amendmentg shal]

Excises and Salt Act, 1944 (1 of 1944y |,

(1) in section 3A (1), for the fllll-stop at the
be substituted and thereafter the follow‘c ey Colop
n o e Mg broyic. S
be added, namely :- Provig, S
Al
“Provided that, if the assessed g
less than five poisha, t}
off to the next higher fi

mount hag ;
1€ assessmeny shall | a
ve poisha,”. Cr
(2) The FIRST SCHEDU

LE shal] be amend
Set out in the FIRST SCHED

edinthe,,
ULE to this Ordinance, "t

Repeal of Act

4. (1 1ft- t, 1963 (X1v :
XIV of 1963 P ]e( d) The Gifi-tax Act, (XIV of 1963), herep,

(2) Notwithstanding its repeal under sub-section (1), the
Gift-tax Act, 1963 (XIV of 1963), and the rules, order
nstructions or directions made or issued thereunder sha]i
continue to apply to the levy and collection of gift-tax payaple
thereunder before the repeal of this Act and to g Proceeding
connected therewith as if the said Act had not been repealeq.

S. In the Wealth-tax Act, 1963 (XV of 1963), in section
5(1) (xii), for the words “Taka one lakh” the words “Taka three
lakh” shall be substituted.

. Amendment of
Act XV of 1963

Amendment of

6. The following amendments shall be made in th
Act IV of 1969

Customs Act, 1969 (IV 0f 1969), namely:-

(1) in section 25, affer sub-section (7), the following new sub-
section shall be added, namely:-

“(8) If the appropriate officer finds that the value Ol.f}’ ‘hi: :
goods declared by the importer in the bill of f{ﬂn %
less than the value determined under thtns Sec[}‘]‘i’cﬁ he
may, without prejudice to any other action ;;J st
may take in respect of the importer or Sucaying i
require the importer to clear the goods onicllJ e
duty on their value determined as aforcsacq;lim ‘
importer is unwilling or fails to do so, a'ng i3 '!.hc _;
on behalf of the Government by pay! i

. ‘ fcner'
importer their value as declared in the bill of

i
7

| Scanhéd Witﬁ'CéﬁﬁScanner

g

gt |
5]

¢
amely._ Made | i

0 theii



T 1985 \
3 Ry ce Ord!nancel :

(2) in the First Schedule,-

(a) against Tariff Heading No. 25.01 in column (1)
against sub-head A.1. in column (2), in column (3),
for the figure “10%” the figure “509;,” shall bf;
substituted,

(b) against Tariff Heading No. 66.03 in column (1), in
~ column (3), for the figure “50%” (he figure
“100%" shall be substituted; and

(c) against Tariff Heading No. 84.10 in column (1), in
column (3), for the figure “50%", wherever
occurring, the figure “100%” shall be substituted.

7. In the Finance Act, 1980 (XXII of 1980), in section Amendment of
1203), for the word, brackets and figure “sub-section (1) the Act XXIITof
words “this section” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to 1980
have been so substituted on and from the 1st day of August, 1984.

8. The following amendments shall be made in the Amendmentof

Income Tax Ordinance, 1984 (XXX VI of 1984), namely:- s dien
or .

(1) in section 32,-

(a) in sub-section (6) (a) (i), for the words “previous
year' the words “income year” shall be substituted,

(b) after sub-section (8), the following new sub-
sections (9), (10) and (11) shall be added, namely:-

. "(9) Notwithstanding anything contained in this
section or section 31, where a capital gain
arises from the transfer of a capital asset being
buildings or lands which, within a period of
one year immediately following the date on
which the transfer took place, is invested in the
acquisition of stocks or shares of public
limited companies which fulfil the conditions
laid down in paragraph 8 of Part B of the Sixth
Schedule and the stocks or shares are held by
the assessee for at least two years from the
date of acquisition, the capital gain shall nat be
charged to tax as income of the year in which
the transfer took place.

(10) Notwithstanding anything contained in this
section or scction 31, where a capital gamn
arises from the transfer of a capital asset being

Scanned with CamScanner



The Finane
1¢e Orfy
Ce,

fgﬁj

buildings or lands 0o a new company register
the Companies Act, 1913 (VII of 1913), ‘hfbr q‘\'d_““dcr
an industry and if the whole amount of Capit‘ak]mn' u
gain i

h

imvested in the equity of the said Company,
capital gain shall not be charged to tax a i“é(;mecnf the
Of th

year in which the transfer took place,

(11) Notwithstanding anything contained in this sectio
section 31, where a capital gain arises o n{}{l}r
transfer of a capital asset of a firm to a new compa e
registered under the Companies Act, 1913 (VIII:,
1913), and if the whole amount of the capital i i;
invested in the equity of the said company by the
partners of the said firm, then the capital gain shaj|
not be charged to tax as income of the year in whic,

the transfer took place.”;

(2) in section 43(4),-

(a) in clause (a) (iii), the words “by way of gift or” shall
be omitted,

(b) in clause (a) (iv), the words “by way of gift or” shall
be omitted,

(¢) in clause (b), the words “by way of gift or” shall be
omitted;

(3) in section 45, after sub-section (2), the following new
sub-sections (2A) and (2B) shall be inserted, namely:-

“(2A) Subject to the provisions of this Ordinance, the
income, profits and gains of an industrial undertaking
set up in Bangladesh between the first day of July,
1985, and the thirtieth day of June, 1990 (both days
inclusive), shall be exempt from the tax payable
under this Ordinance for the period specified below-

(a) if the undertaking is set up in such areas as the
Board may, by notification in the ojﬁCfﬁ’
Gazette, specify to be “Special Economic Zone
for a period of twelve years beginning with {1°
month of commencement of commerci
production of the undertaking;

(b) if the undertaking is set up in such areas 33 ﬂzj
Board may, by notification in the 9
Gazette, specify to be “Least Developed Nca{;é .
for a period of nine years beginning W ccidl

-month of commencement of CcOM™e
production of the undertaking;

- S'c':'a'ﬁun-éd with CamScanner



Financeé

i Jm;ﬂce,' 1985

(c) if the undertaking IS set up in gycp areas as the

Board may, by notification in (e official Gazette:
specify to be “Less [.)ev_clopcd Areas”| for 5 perioci
of six years beginning i, the month of
commencement of commercia| Production of (he

undertaking; and

(d) if the undertaking is set up jy the city of Dhaka,
- Chittagong or Khulna or (e Municipality of
Narayanganj, or within tep miles from the outer
limits thereof, for a period of four years beginning
with the month of sommencement of commercial
production of the undertaking,

(2B) The exemption under sub-section (2A) shall apply to an

industrial undertaking (hereinafter referred to as the

“said under taking™) which fulfils the following
conditions, namely:-

(a) that the said undertaking is owned and managed by-

() a body corporate established by, or in
pursuance of, an Act of Parliament with its
head office in Bangladesh; or

(i) a company registered under the Companies Act,
1913 (VII of 1913), with its registered office in
Bangladesh and having a subscribed and paid
up capital of not less than one lakh taka on the
date of commencement of commercial
production;

(b) that the sajd undertaking belongs to such class of
industry as the Board may, by notification in the

official Gazette, specify for the purpose of this sub-
Section;

() lha‘.a Part of the income exempted under this Sut}-
Section s reinvested in the said undertaking or is
nvested in (he purchase of bond issued by the

GO\'emmcnl and such reinvestment or investment is
Nnot-

0 less than five per cenr of such income, if itis an
underlaking Sct up in the areas referred to in
SUb-section (2A) (a) and (b):

(i) less hap, fifteen per cenr of such income? if it is
M undertaking se up in the areas referred to in
S”b‘St‘clion (2A)(¢); and

Scanned with CamScanner



The F thance Orgj
faldlel P
.1985

(1) less than thirty per cepn, of such ;
industrial undertaking set up i o

- 1 the gp,. it
to in sub-section (2A)(d): areg

. ()
3 roge 0

Treg
(d) that the S.ﬂld undertaking is approve and
relevant income ycar, stands appr,
for the purposes of this section;

(e) that the application in the Prescribeq fo
approval for the purposes of (hjs SECtion, gy, TOr
in the prescribed manner, s made to the Boarq “Tiulf'd
one hundred and twenty days from the dape 3
commencement of commercig] Productiop: i

Provided that the Board may admit an applicatiop afier
the expiry of the said period of op

twenty days if it is satisfied that ther

; Lo e Was sufficien,
cause for not making the application Within the said
period.”;

(4) in section 46, after sub-section (2),

the follom'ng new
sub-sections (2A) and (2B) shall be ins

erted, namely..

“(2A) Subject to the provisions
income, profits and gains of
in Bangladesh between the
and the thirtieth day of
inclusive), shall be exemp
under this Ordinance, for the

of this Ordinance, the
a tourist industry set up
first day of July, 1985,
June, 1990 (both -days
t from the tax payable
period specified below-
(a) if the indust

Ty is set up in such areas as the
Board may,

by notification in the officil
Gazette, specify to be “Special Economic Zone",
for a period of twelve years beginning with the

month of commencement of jts commercidl
Service;

(b) if the industry is set Up in such areas as th?
Board may, by notification in the Oﬂfﬂﬁ
Gazette, specify to be “Least Developed ;f;reai e’
for a period of nine years beginning with *

; rc]ﬂl
month of commencement of jts comme
service;

| o
(c) if the industry is set up in such areas as:ct:'af

Board may, by notification in the Kreas".
Gazelte, specify to be “Less DCVCIF'P"’d St the
for a period of six years beginning mmgrc_l'?l-,_
month of commencement of its s
service; and B

Seanhed with Camscanmss



" fheFin

e

ance Ordinance, 1 985

(d) if the industry is set y
Chittagong or Khulna
Rajshahi, or within fifte
limits thereof, for a
beginning with the mont
its commercial service,

P in the city of Dhaka,
or the municipality of
en miles from the outer
period of four years
h of commencement of

" (2B) The exemption under sub-section (2A) shall apply to a
tourist industry (hereinafter referred tq as the “said
industry”), which fulfils the following conditions
namely:- ’

(a) that the said industry is owned and managed by a
Bangladeshi company having a subscribed and paid
up capital of not less than one lakh taka on the date
of commencement of its commercial service;

(b) that the said industry shall have such service
facilities as the Board may, by notification in the
official Gazette, specify in this behalf:

(c) that a part of the income, profits and gains derived
from the said industry exempted under sub-section
(2A) is reinvested in it or is invested in the purchase
of bond issued by the Government and such
reinvestment or investment is not-

(i) less than five per cent of such income, profits
and gains, if it is an industry set up in the areas
referred to in sub-sections (2A)(a) and (b);

+

(ii) less than fifteen per cent of such income,
profits and gains, if it is an industry set up in
the areas referred to in sub-section (2A)(c);

(iii) less than thirty per cent of such income, profits
and gains, if it is an industry set up In the areas
referred to in sub-section (2A)(d);

) that an application in the prescribed form for
approval for the purposes of this scction. as verified
I the prescribed manner, is made to the Board-
Within one hundred and twenty days of the date o
Commencement of commercial service;

()

d. during the

that..the  said- industry is & ed an
¢ said industry 1s approved <
4 i the Board

;Clt‘\'anl income year, stands approved by
Or the purposes of this section.”;

Scanned with CamScanner



The Finane,

re h“ ) :
Iee 1908
¥ 8 3

(5) inscction 47 (1). in the Explanation, in Clause )
S¢ (a).-

(a) in sub-clause (ii), for the wordy “fiftv the (
the words “‘one lakh taka™ shal] be .mi)s“-“llnaml takq

Ued; ang
(b) in sub-clause (iii), for the word

: “len”
“fifteen” shall be substituted:

(6) in section 49 (1), after clause (b), the followip, !
clause (bb) shall be inserted, namely:- s fey |
*(bb) income derived from fixed deposits in banks;" 1

(7) after section 51, the following new section S1A shal] p, “

inserted, namely:-

“51A. Deduction at source from interest on fixeg |
deposits.- Any person responsible for paying any !
sum by way of interest on any fixed deposit
maintained with any scheduled bank including a ¢o.

operative bank or by way of share of profit op term

deposit maintained with any bank run on Islamic

principles, as the case may be, shall deduct, at the
time of credit of such interest or share of profit to the

account of the recipient, being resident, or at the time |

of the payment thereof, whichever is earlier, income |
tax at the following rates, namely:-

()  Where the amount of Nil
deposit does not exceed
Taka 40,000

(i)  Where the amount of 10 per cent of the sumd
deposit exceeds Taka interest or share of pmﬁt,__._
40,000 as the case may be, o the

whole of such deposit:

Provided that nothing contained in this section shall 3PPI§ :
to such recipient or class of recipients as the Boar

may, by a general or special order, specify it thi
behalf.”;

. hall

(8) in section 66, Jor the full-stop at the end, a C"_Ion snlew

be substituted and thereafier the following ™" .

proviso shall be added, namely:- . e

“Provided that, if before the fifteenth qa)’ of lziled-in ;
year, an assessment of the assessee _}g.,_c_;_omp o

" Seanfsdwith GamSEarier



o Ordinaneei @85 i s S s T

" pjeFinan

¥ respect of an income year, |

: . ater than thay
basis of which the tax w on the

S computed under sect;
. €cuio
65. the assessee shall pay iy ope instalment on lhrt:

specified  date  or in equal instalments on (he
specified dates, if more (hap one falling after (he
date of the said assessment, the (ax computed on the

revised basis as reduced by the amount, if any, paid

in accordance with the original computation.”;

(9) in section 75(2) (d), for the words *

_ ‘fifty thousand taka”
the words “eighty thousand taky”

shall be substituted,;
(10) in the Third Schedule, in paragraph 11,-

(a) in clause (3), in the proviso, for the words “one
hundred and fifty thousand taka”, occurring twice,
the words “two lakh taka” shall be substituted; and

(b) in clause (6) (a), for the words “one hundred and

fifty thousand taka” the words “two lakh taka” shall
be substituted;

—

(11) in the Sixth Schedule,-
(a) inPart A -

(1) in paragraphs 10, 11 and 13, for the words “five
thousand taka”, wherever occurring, the words
“fifteen thousand taka” shall be substituted:

(i) in paragraph 14(d), for the full-stop at the end a

- semi-colon shall be substituted and thereafter

the following new sub-paragraphs (e) and (f)
shall be added, namely:-

“(e) in respect of a building the erection of
which is begun and completed at any time
between the first day of July, 1985 and the
thirtieth day of June, 1990 (both days
inclusive), and the building is imel_lded to
be, and is actually, used for residential
purposes only, for a period of five years
from the date of such completion, subject
to the following limits, namely:-

() in a case where the ... the whole_of
annual value of such such value;
building does not
exceed fifteen

thousand taka,

Scanned with CamScanner



The Finance O”dfna" : g
Sl
) as

in a case where the ... fifteen

annual value of such thousand

building exceeds taka: .
fifteen thousand :
taka,

Provided that where an assessee claims exempy;
respect of more than one such b;lil‘dT{ptmn in
exemption under this clause shall be festlr?g' the
such portion of the aggregate annual value g}ed U
building as does not exceed fifteen thousand taka.SUCh i

(f) in respect of a building the erection of which is be

and completed at any time between the first da -
July, 1985 and the thirtieth day of June, 1990 (gof}f
days inclusive), and which is intended to be, and js !
actually, used for residential purposes only, for 3
period of five years from the date of such completion
subject to the condition that the plinth area of 1hé
building is not more than one thousand square feet.
The exemption under this clause shall also applyin |

the case of housing Fompamcs_, SOCIRHIES AN, SRS
where the construction comprises bungalows ilats)
apartments or units (hereinafter referred to as units)
each containing plinth area of not more than one
thousand square feet provided the construction
comprises not less than twenty-five units.”;

(iii) in paragraph 22, at the end an explanation shall be added,
namely:- -

“Explanation.- In this paragraph, “public limited -

companies” means companies-

(i) in which not less than fifty per cent shares arc

held by the Government, Or

(ii) whose shares werc subject of dealings in 2
registered Stock Exchange in Bangladesh .3‘ W
time during the income year and remained I'I‘f"c‘j L
the Stock Exchange till the close of that year-

Il

(iv) afier paragraph 22, the following new paragraph 2

be added, namely:-

an assessee, being l-hcriali".‘ y

literary works © ::icfor

roved by the (e oty

h from such wor 2

»23, Any income derived by
or co-author, of such
nature as may be app
purposc of this paragrap

Scanned with CamScanner



VSl S e

— e e

The Finar

:
i
4
i
4

e Ordinance, 1985

Bangladesh Tax Update

www.kdroy.com.bd/www.ltr.com.bd

(b) in Part B.-

G in paragraph  10(1)(b), afier the words *“unit
certificate”, the words “and mutual fund cernificate™
shall be inserted; and

(i) in paragraph !8, Jor the words *“‘an individual” the
words ‘‘a salaried employee” shall be substituted.

9. (1) Subject to the provisions of sub-sections (2), (3), (4),
(5) and (6), in making any assessment for the year beginning on
the first day of July, 1985, income tax shall be charged at the
rates as specified in the Second Schedule. ‘

(2) In making any assessment for the year beginning on the
first day of July, 1985,-

(a) where the total income of an assessee, not being a
company, includes any income chargeable under the
head “Salaries” or any income chargeable under the head
“Interest on securities”, the income tax pavable by the
assessee on that part of his total income which consists
of such inclusion shall be an amount bearing to the total
amount of income tax payable according to the rates
applicable under the operation of the Finance Ordinance,
1984 (XLII of 1984), on his total income the same
proportion as the amount of such inclusion bears to his
total income; and

(b) where the total income of a company includes any profits
and gains from Life Insurance business, the income tax
payable by the company shall be reduced by an amount
equal to 12.5 per cent of that part of its total income
which consists of such inclusion.

lrsl(?j)aln making any assessment for the year beginning on !he
Socigy Y of July, 1985, where the assessee is a co—operatl\jc

% the tax shall be payable at the rate specified in
P A or B(i)(d) of the Second Schedule, whichever

1 "
S more beneficial to the assessee:

va‘ ; g
SCelion tded that i calculating for the purpose of this sub-

I’i"ﬂgr:;ph;k amount of income tax at the rates specified in
any allg of the Second Schedule, no deduction in respect of

Wa X "
Parg "€ Or sums referred to in the proviso to the said

graph shal| pe made

Scanned with CamScanner

Income tax



(4) (a) In making any assessment for the year be

The Finance g,.4; il
' 985

E]
|

the first day of July, 1985, where the total income oF a‘n

assessee other a company not. registered
includes any profits and gains derived from thc. €XPOIT of goq
out of Bangladesh, income tax payable by hl.m_ in respeqy
such profits and gains shall, subject to the provisions of cia
(b) and (c), be reduced by an amount computed in the mg,

specified hereunder:-

(M)

(ii)

Where the goods exported
abroad had not been
manufactured by the
assessee who exported them:

(a) and where the export
sales during the
relevant year
exceed the export
sales of the
preceding year;

(b) and where the export
sales during the
relevant year do not
exceed the export
sales of the
preceding vear;

Where the goods exported
had been manufactured by

the assessee who had
exported them:
(a) where the export

sales do not exceed
10 per cent of the
total sales:

(b)

(c)

where the export sales exceed
10 per cent but do not exceed
] 21" Ay ¥ -

20 per cent of the total sales;

where the- export sales exceed
20 per cent but do not exceed
30 per cent of the total sales:

N Banglageg
ds
of
S€s
ner

Amount.

30 per cent of the income tax
attributable to export sales.

Plus an additional 1 per cen
for every increase of 10 per
cent 1n export sales over those
of the preceding year, subject
to an overall maximum of 40
per cent.

minus 1 per cent for every
decrease of 10 per cent in
export sales from those of the
preceding year, subject to an
overall minimum of 20 per
cent.

Nil.

30 per cent of th o
tax attributable t©@
sales,

40 per cent
tax attributd
sales.

“ S'c.:'anriedﬂ\:n}'itﬁ CamScann

el
of the in<®"
e

=

er

o incomé




g _
Jance Ordinance, 1985 . F

The Fit

(d) Where the export sales exceed 50 per cent of the income
30 per cont but do not exceed tax attributable to cxpont
40 per cent of the total salcs; sales.

(¢) where the export sales exceed 60 per cent of the income
40 per cent of the total sales; tax attributable to export
sales:

Provided that the terms “export of goods out of Bangladesh”,
“goods exported abroad” and “export sales” used in this
clause shall include sale of locally manufactured machinery,
equipment and other finished products within the country to
any agency against its procurement programme in foreign
exchange. /

(b) Nothing contained in clause (a) shall apply in respect of
the following goods or classes of goods, namely:-

(1) tea;

(1) raw jute;

(iii) jute manufactures;

(iv) raw hides and skin and wet-blue leather;

(v) such other goods as may be notified by the National
Board of Revenue from time to time.

\E,?l The National Board of Revenue may mak_e rules

expor:.% for the computation of profits and the tax attributable

give f;ales and for such other matters as may be necessary
ellect to the provisions of this sub-section.

pro
o
lo

HFSI(Z);,;H Takmg any assessment for the year beginning on the
Other lhag Huly, 1985, where the total income of an ?ssessec
dny prﬂﬁtsa co'“Pflny not registered in Bangladesh, includes
" passep and gains derived from plying of passenger buses
ey -ﬁvcger launches, a rebate shall be allowed at the rate of

4 gaine 6" Cent of the income tax attributable to profits

| S derj
a““‘311(:5, “fived from such passenger buses and passenger

Scanned with CamScanner



(4) (a) In making any assessment for the year ba
the first day of July, 1985, where the total incom
assessec other a company not registered in
includes any profits and gains derived from the expo
out of Bangladesh, income tax payable by him ip

The Finance Or dingy <
Cel 198 i
3

Elnmng on
of an

Bangladesh’ '

respectof

such profits and gains shall, subject to the provisiong of clauge
(b) and (c), be reduced by an amount computed in the ma,m:r
specified hereunder:-

(1)

(i)

Where the goods exported
abroad had not been
manufactured by the
assessee who exported them:

(a) and where the export
sales during the
relevant year
exceed the export
sales of the
preceding year;

(b) and where the export
sales during the
relevant year do not
exceed the export
sales of the
preceding year;

Where the goods exported
had been manufactured by

the assessee who had
exported them:
(a) where the export

sales do not exceed
10 per cent of the
total sales;

(b) where the export sales exceed
1O per cent but do not exceed
20 per cent of the total sales:

(c) where the export sales exceed
20 per cent but do not exceed
30 per cent of the total sales:

Amount,

30 per cent of the income tax
attributable to export sales.

Plus an additional 1 per cep
for every increase of 10 per
cent in export sales over those
of the preceding year, subject
to an overall maximum of 40
per cent.

minus 1 per cent for every
decrease of 10 per cent in
export sales from those of the
preceding year, subject to an
overall minimum of 20 per
cent.

Nil.

- aeoimé
30 per cent of the ujipi‘
tax attributable 1© ¢
sales.

colﬂf
poft

the I
, or ('L’f” Or
40 p 1 l0_'c"

ax attributab

sales.,

Scanned with Ca

mScanner



okl ses CAvdinance, 1985 : .
1 = t)_O!d“In * i i
L The memc *.

E) \Where the export sales exceed 50 per cent of the income
30 per cent but do not exceed tax attributable to cxport

40 per cenl of the total sales; sales.
(¢) where the export sales exceed 60 per cent of the income
40 per cent of the total sales; tax attributable to export
sales:

Provided that the terms “export of goods out of Bangladesh”,
“goods exported abroad” and “export sales” used in this
clause shall include sale of locally manufactured machinery,
equipment and other finished products within the country to
any agency against its procurement programme in foreign
exchange. .

(b) Nothing contained in clause (a) shall apply in respect of
. the following goods or classes of goods, namely:-

i (1) tea,

| (i) raw jute;

(ii1) jute manufactures;

(iv) raw hides and skilj and wet-blue leather;

(v) such other goods as may be notified by the National
Board of Revenue from time to time.

(¢) The National Board of Revenue may make rules
{”Oviding for the computation of profits and the tax attributable
IE €xport sales and for such other matters as may be necessary

gtve effect to the provisions of this sub-section.

() In making any assessment for the year beginning on the

1
f °:fl:trd?ly 2 July, 1985, where the total income of an gssessce
:FJI any pr 1an a company not registered in Bangladesh, includes

- DaOﬁtS and gains derived from plying of passengert buses
( lw"“‘y&ige“g@r launches, a rebate shall be allowed at the rate. of
V€ per cent of the income tax attributable to profits

Bains deri er
{0 lungyeg derived from such passenger buses and passeng

Scanned with CamScanner



¢, f935

(6) In cases to which the Second Schedule ¢

Tax Ordinance, 1984 (XXXVI of 1984) . ¢ In

), appli Ome
chargeable shall be determined as provided Plies, g lay

in that ¢
with reference to the rates imposed by Sub-secuonh“,‘;“lc

accordance, where applicable, with the Provisions
section (2).

by
» Or in

f sub.

-(7) For the purpose of making deduction of
Chapter VII of the Income Tax Ordinance,
1984), the rates specified in the Second Sche
respects the year beginning on the first da
ending on the thirtieth day of June, 1986.

tax u“dc
1984 (XXX o
dule shall apply gz

y of July, 1985, ang

(8) For the purposes of this section and of the rates of tay
imposed thereby, the expression “total income” means tota|
income as determined for the purpose of income ta

X in-
accordance with the provisions of the Income Tax Ordinance,
1984 (XXX VI of 1984).

THE FIRST SCHEDULE

(See section 3)

Amendment of the FIRST SCHEDULE to the Excises and
Salt Act, 1944
(I of 1944).

In PART |-

(a) in SECTION 1V, for Item No. 04. 07 the following shall b¢
substituted, namely:-

“04. 07 Matches-

“*Matches™ include a firework in the form of a mﬂ:gt
and where a match stick has more heads than onc E;}l)l be
of being ignited by striking, cach such head 3
deemed to be a match. it

. i

o
aining )
(1) Matches in boxes or booklcls_C_Olll. 3
average-

o Scéhnéa with CamScanner



é Ordinance, 1983

(i) ~notmore than forty matches  Taka five

Per gross of boxes or
booklets. :
(i) ~ morc than forty but not more

Taka six ang poisha twenty-
than fifty matches '

five per gross of boxes or
booklets,

(i) more than fifty but not more

Taka seven and poisha fifty per
than sixty matches

gross of boxes or booklets.

(ivy ~more than sixty but not more  Taka ten per gross of boxes or
than eighty matches booklets.

(2)  All other matches. Taka one and poisha twenty-

five for every one thousand
four hundred and forty matches
or fraction thereof.™:;

(b) in SECTION V, in Item No. 05.02(1), clause (d) in the second

column and the entries relating thereto in the third column
shall be omirted;

(c) in SECTION VIII -

(1) for Item No. 08.06 the following shall be substituted,
namely:-

“08.06 Woollen yamn, all sorts, Thirty per cent ad
including knitting wool , valorem.”,

(i) in Item No. 08.07 , for sub-items(2), (3) and (4) the following
shall be substituted, namely :-

“(2) Blankets and shawls Thirty per cent ad
valorem.

(3) Knitted woollen articles Thirty per cent ad
valorem.

(4) Woollen fabrics not otherwise Thirty per cent ad
specified valorem.”,

(d) in SECTION IX, in Item No. 09.03, in column 3, for the word
“twenty-five” the words “one hundred” shall be substituted;

(€) in SECTION X, in Item No. 10.03, i column 3, for the entry
“Taka one thousand per metric ton.” the entry “Ten per cent
ad valorem,”: shall be substituted,;

( ® in SECTION X11 -

) l.n Item No. 12.08, in column 3, for the entry “Taka ﬂ:l‘:: Pg:
linear metre of each print.” the entry “Taka two lakhs p
m.” shall e substituted,

Scanned with CamScanner



The Finance Ordf"ance I
o 19gs

(i) after Item No. 12.08, the following new Item No, |
be added, namely:-

“12.09 Tarpaulin, all sorts Ten per cent q4 Valore,
".1!.

2.09 sha]|

THE SECOND SCHEDULE
(See section 9)

Rates of Income tax

' A. In the case of every individual, Hindu undivided family

unregistered firm, an association of persons and every artificig|
juridical person referred to in section 2(46) of the Income Ty
Ordinance, 1984 (XXXVI of 1984), not being a case to which,
paragraph B applies-

Rates,
(1) On the first taka 50,000 of taxable income .. .. 10%
(2) On the next taka 50,000 of taxable income .. .. 20%
(3) On the next taka 50,000 of taxable income .. .. 30%
(4) On the next taka 50,000 of taxable income .. .. 40%
(5) On the balance of taxable income o it o 50%:

Provided that-

(1) no income tax shall be payable on a total income, which
before the deduction of the sums, if any, exempted under
paragraphs 1 to 14, 17, 18 and 20 of Part B of the Sixth
Schedule to the Income Tax Ordinance, 1984 (XXXVI of
1984), does not exceed taka 30,000; and

(i1) theincome tax payable shall in no case exceed-

(a) one-third of the amount by which the total income exceeds
taka 30,000, or

(b) the amount representing fifty per cent of the total income,
whichever amount is the less:

Provided further that in the case of a person, olher‘than F;l
company, being resident in Bangladesh bringing incom=
accruing and arising outside Bangladesh into Bangladesh
through official channels, income tax shall be charge 3:
the rate of thirty per cent of such income or at the ™
applicable to his total income including such income
whichever is more beneficial to him.

Explanation.- The expression “taxable income”,
this paragraph, means the taxable income as
section 2(63) of the Income Tax Ordinanc®
(XXXVI of 1984).

as used M
defined 17

) Sca'n'ned \}vith CamScanner



ﬂ' Fmaﬂc‘? ordinance, 1985 :
- hef

3. In the case of every company _al}d local authority and in
g . which under the provisions of the Income Tax

e n .
onance, 1984 (XXX VIof 1984), income tax is to be charged

Rates.

) On the whole of the total income
: excluding  the amount representing

ir'lcome from dividends from a company
' s registered  office in

having

Bangladesh-

@ in the case of every industrial 45 per cent of such
company being a publicly traded income.
company,

(b) in the case of every industrial 50 per cent of such
company not being a publicly income.
traded company,

(c) in the case of all other companies 60 per cent of such
including banks, financial income.
institutions and local authorities,

(d) in the case of a person not being a 30 per cent of such
company who is not resident in Income:
Bangladesh,

Provided that a rebate at the rate of 10 per cent of the tax shall be
allowed to a company registered in Bangladesh under the
Companies Act, 1913 (VII of 1913), on so much of its
income, profits and gains accruing or arising outside
Bangladesh to which section 9(4) of this Ordinance does not
apply as are brought by it into Bangladesh:

Provided further that a company registered in Bangladesh under
the Companies Act, 1913 (VII of 1913), and engaged in the
production of goods shall be allowed rebate on income tax
payable by it at the following rates in the manner specified
hereunder:-

Amount.

) :;llcre the production in volume of 2.5 per cent of the
buLl fgi‘cvam vear exceeds 15 per cent  incomc lar
the = MOk cxcgcd 25 per CC’fh’ of :_mnbutablc to such

production in volume of the ncome.
Preceding vear:

(b)

W

rl;?cr(\:al:f ?l‘oduclion in volume of the 5 per cent of :l,:f
the prod\car. CXC?CdS 25 per cent of income .Lc-h
Preced; uction in volume of the ;'mnbutable to St
R income.

Scanned with CamScanner



The Finance Ordiy
ane
e,

0)

representing 15 per ey,
from dividends declared ;

d by a company registered

in  Bangladesh under  the

Companies  Acl, 1913 (VII of
1913), or a body corporatc

formed in pursuance of an Act of
Parliament in respect of the share
capital issued, subscribed and

paid after the 14th day of August,
1947,

Explanation 1.- The expression “industrial company” meap,
company which is mainly engaged- a

(i) On the amount
income

and pai

(i) in the manufacture or processing of goods,

(ii) in the manufacture of plants, machinery, tools ap
implements or accessories of all descriptions,

(1ii) in Fhe construction of vessels, or in the manufacture of
vehicles,

(iv) in the exploration and extraction of gas, oil or any other
minerals:

Provided that the income, profits and gains of the industrial
company attributable to one or more of the undertakings
fnenuoned above and included in its total income of the
income year is not less than two-thirds of such total income.

Expll:;]r}ation 2.- ihe term “publicly traded company”, as used in
is paragraph, means a public limited ¢ chich fulfls
the following conditions:- R

(a) it is an industrial company;

(b) the paid-up capital of '
SO Iall:}?; capital of the company is not les_s than taka

2 .
(c) .zrlclleg;ttlle% of lhg paid-up capital of the company as a by
e € accounting year is subscribed by the shareholder®

an the Directors and sponsors of the company;

d
(d) g:;rsharc of the company has been purchased in benami by ¢
ectors and sponsors of the company;

(e) average ownershi
ership of shares of th '
e co at leas!
each taka 20,000 of the paid-up capital‘ml iy

| for

Scanned with CamScanner



Th Fihanee'Ordf"“""e' li7d) \
The F!

| ai least 10% dividend has been declared and distributed to
the shareholders of the company out of the profits of the
accounting year for which assessment is to be made; and

(g) the shares of the company are listed in a Stock Exchange
before the end of the accounting year for which assessment
is to be made.

C. In the case of every registered firm, the income tax shall
be charged at the following rates:-

Rate.
(1) On the first taka 30.000 of total income .. Nil
(2) On the next taka 30,000 of total income .. 10%
(3) On the next taka 70,000 of total income .. 15%
(4) On the next taka 70,000 of total income .. 20%
(5) On the balance of total income .. .. 25% :

Provided that income tax shall not be payable by a
registered firm in respect of the income, profits and gains
deriveq by it from the exercise of a profession if such income,
profits and gains depend wholly or mainly on the personal
Qualifications of its partners who are prevented by any law for
he time being in force or by convention or rules or regulations
?hhe professional association, society or similar body of which
W;:li are 'mf:’mber_s to F:onstitute themselves.into a corporate body
undera llil‘mted liability which can be registered as a companf.'
Pf0fcsgl' e Com.pames Act, 1913 (VII of 1913?), unless such
on 1o on consists wholly or mainly in the making of contracts

0 :
behalf of ofher persons or the giving to other persons o

adV[cQ i :
CUIIIrwc?ra commercial nature in connection with the making of
acts,
Bangladesh Tax Update
E l www kdroy.com.bd/www.ltr.com.bd ] ]
&p anati S " d in this
: 1on.- The {c “repistered firm”, as used 1
mr“graph term “‘regisicl | of the

 Means a firm registered under section 11

¢ lax Ordinance, 1984 (XXXVIof 1984).

Scanned with CamScanner



